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Introducing 

 

The present invention comprises a novel water purifying device generating a state of 
ozone in water generally consisting of a AC or battery power supply, system control 
unit, high voltage coil, 3-D printed housing for the high voltage coil and an 
interchangeable glass vial containing water and electrically conductive chemical 
elements. When the unit is turned on, the high voltage arc created by the high 
voltage coils is put into a suspended state of potential therefore no high voltage arcs 
are emitted through the glass vial. The suspended state of the high voltage arc 
prevents any ozone to be created in the atmosphere. Only and exclusively when the 
glass vial is in contact with a vessel containing water, the high voltage arc passes 
through the wall of the glass vial, passes through the wall of container holding the 
water and then creates a state of ozone in the water held in the container 
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Should the high voltage glass vial come in contact with the surface of any biological 
entities, there are no electrical or physical consequences or contraindications. The 
ozone created by the high voltage arc and the liquid in the vial have no consequences 
or contraindications when coming into contact with internal biological soft tissues and 
cells. 

Covid-19 Cases 

A 59-year old Hispanic male with type 2 diabetes worked his construction job on 
Saturday June 13, 2020 in the Palm Springs, California area while feeling good and 
high energy. 

The male came as referral from Juan Gonzalez – see Juan and his brother David 
featured in the video posted on the Tri-Vortex homepage – http://trivortex.com   

On Monday he started having body aches, head pain, shortness of breath, chest 
congestion and fatigue. 

Tuesday he only worked a half day. 

On Wednesday he was diagnosed with positive Covid-19 via a swab test at Eisenhower 
Hospital. 

Because he had no insurance, the doctors released him with instruction not to work 
for 10 days. He was not scheduled for a follow-up swab test. Why not? 

The intensity of the symptoms increased over the next three days and an appointment 
was scheduled for 3:00pm Saturday June 20, 2020 with the Tri-Vortex Institute. 

Male stated that his blood sugars run as high as 225-250 and his major complaint was 
the chest congestion and body aches and were demonstrated when he walked to the 
bathroom before the session began. His skin color was stark white. 

The male was instructed to drink three six-ounce glasses of distilled water ozonated 
by the Trans-O-Zone unit invented by me and Electrical Engineer Mike Schuckel. See 
illustration below and attached. 

Male stated he felt as if his blood sugars were very high. 

The skin color improved as male laid face-up on the Tri-Vortex vibrating massage 
table. 

A Trans-O-Zone vial not connected to any electronics was placed on the back of the 
neck to function as a ground for the Trans-O-Zone. 
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The Trans-O-Zone vial was applied over both lungs for five minutes each and then 
applied to each sole of the feet for 15 minutes each. 

A Tri-Intra-Sound device was applied to tibia to lower blood sugar levels. 

After Trans-O-Zone session concluded, male breathed via cannulas a combination of 
ozone passed through a proprietary mix of oils for 10 minutes. Ozone was carried by 
an ordinary aquarium air pump and the Tri-Vortex Oxygen Ion generator. 

Male then breathed via cannulas a combination of ozone passed through silver 
hydrosol for 10 minutes 

Session concluded with ozone passed through oils for five minutes. 

Male had no symptoms whatsoever, declared he had never felt better and was ready 
to return to work. Male’s second trek to the bathroom was with normal gate and no 
pain. 

Male stated that he felt his blood sugars were normal. 

Male was scheduled for second session on Sunday June 21, 2020 but gave his time to 
his wife who has numerous health issues. 

Next email will document her journey to balance. 

The Trans-O-Zone units are for sale at a price of $3000.00 and will address any health 
issue by improving the quality of life. 

We are gearing up for mass production so delivery could be 20 to 30 days after full 
payment. Due to high demand, samples are not available.  

This fax is sent to special people associated with the Tri-Vortex Institute 
 

The Wife Came to the Tri-Vortex Institute 

The wife, of the diabetic man who had one Trans-O-Zone session for diagnosed 
Covid-19 condition, came to the Tri-Vortex Institute the day after her husband 
finished his one successful session. 

The man does not speak good English and I do not understand Spanish therefore I 
misunderstood why the wife wanted to experience the Tri-Vortex Institute as soon 
as possible. 

The wife did not have a swab or blood test but she was experiencing the same flu 
symptoms as her husband but not as severe because she does not have diabetes. 
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Her symptoms without diabetes created the opportunity to apply just the Trans-O-
Zone and no other Tri-Vortex devices. 

She drank three six-ounce glasses of distilled water ozonated by the Trans-O-Zone 
and immediately laid on the massage table. 

A Trans-O-Zone vial not connected to any electronics, and functioning as a ground 
for the vial of the Trans-O-Zone, was placed on the back of her neck. The Trans-O-
Zone vial was applied to both lung areas for five minutes each for a total of 10 
minutes on the lungs.  

The Trans-O-Zone was then applied to the bottom of each foot for 25 minutes for a 
total of 50 minutes on the feet. 

The session lasted one hour and she departed completely symptom free. 

Her husband remained symptom free but developed moderate kidney pain overnight 
not related to the flu. Two Tri-Vortex Discs (http://trivortex.com/Disc.html ) were 
applied to his kidneys while his wife was completing her session. He slowly drank 
three six-ounce glasses of ozonated distilled water treated by the Trans-O-Zone. All 
pain gone in 30 minutes. 

After her session I explained to them the importance of proper water hydration and 
how being dehydrated contributed to them developing the flu symptoms. 

They purchased the two discs I put on his kidneys and they departed both symptom 
free and aware of proper water hydration. 

A follow-up report will be made at the end of the week. 

Third Covid-19 Case 

A 32-year old Hispanic male began having severe chest pains, shortness of breath and 
lung congestion on Friday June 19, 2020. 

On Saturday June 20, 2020 he was diagnosed positive for Covid-19 via a swab test at 
Eisenhower Hospital in Palm Springs, California. 

He made an appointment at 5pm Tuesday, June 23, 2020 for a session at the Tri-
Vortex Institute. 

His breathing was very labored and I could hear whizzing even though he was wearing 
a face mask. 

He stated that he felt that a heavy boot was on his mid chest area as he pointed to his 
sternum. 
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He drank three six-ounce glasses of distilled water ozonated by the Trans-O-Zone. 

I fitted the ground glass vial on the back of his neck while he laid on the vibrating 
massage table. 

I placed the vial of the Trans-O-Zone on his sternum for five minutes. 

When I removed the Trans-O-Zone, he said all the tightness, heaviness and pain were 
gone in the sternum area but felt pressure and congestion in both of his lungs. 

I placed the Trans-O-Zone on his left lung for five minutes. 

When I removed the Trans-O-Zone he stated he only felt pressure and congestion in 
this right lung. 

I placed the Trans-O-Zone on his right lung for five minutes. 

I had him sit-up, take off his mask and take numerous deep and long breaths through 
the nose and mouth. 

Fifteen minutes into the session he was completely symptom free. 

I put the Trans-O-Zone on each foot for 15 minutes – total 30 minutes. 

I put the Trans-O-Zone on the left, mid and right chest area for one-minute each – 
total three minutes. 

As a reinfection preventative he breathed air via cannulas generated by an aquarium 
pump that passed the gas through the Tri-Vortex Ion Oxygen Generator, an ozone 
generator and a proprietary blend of oils. 

He then breathed air via cannulas generated by an aquarium pump that passed the 
gas through the Tri-Vortex Ion Oxygen Generator, an ozone generator and silver 
hydrosol. 

His wife tested negative on Saturday but she is also having breathing problems. Upon 
further investigation I discovered they were wearing their face masks most of the day 
and only took them off when sleeping. His wife is scheduled for a session at 5pm on 
Wednesday, June 24, 2020. 

The proprietary ingredients in the distilled water vial of the Trans-O-Zone are 
probably major contributing factors to why even the most difficult flu symptoms have 
fast release. 
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Fourth Covid-19 Case 

The 30-year-old wife of the Third Covid-19 case entered the Tri-Vortex Institute 
with a fire engine red face, extreme fatigue, chest pain, shortness of breath, glazed 
drooping eyes and a lost demeanor. She had a fever of at least 100 degrees.  

Even though she had tested negative regarding the Covid-19 swab test the previous 
Saturday, had she walked into the emergency room instead the Tri-Vortex Institute, 
there was a high probability she would have been hospitalized – if she had insurance 
but has none. 

And there are long-term complications. She has been diagnosed with fibromyalgia and 
multiple sclerosis. The fibromyalgia was at a high intense level and the MS pain was 
severely impacting the pinky and ring fingers of both hands. The 117-degree heat of 
Palm Desert was another complicating factor. 

During late 2019 she had completed a glucose-tolerance test and was diagnosed as 
borderline diabetic. There was no doubt by me that her blood-sugar level was very 
high. 

And added to that the family native home is in a country of Central America. While 
visiting friends in Cathedral City, California, their two-year old daughter was 
hospitalized for pneumonia at the beginning the Covid-19 crisis in March. The US will 
not let the couple and their two children leave and their home country will not let 
them return. Lots of stress is an understatement. 

Within five minutes this somewhat routine session had transformed into one the most 
critical cases I have ever encountered. Momma had to get better. Every resource, 
trick, angle and magic I had developed or used over the past 30 years were pressed 
into service. 

She drank three six-ounce glasses of distilled water ozonated by the Trans-O-Zone. 
She breathed hydrogen rich gas – HydrOxy - produced by the AquaCure Model AC50. 

Tri-Infrared Bulbs (TIBS) were put into the palms of hands. A Nano Oxygen 
Accelerator (NOA) was aimed at her feet. A Tri-Intra-Sound unit was placed on her 
tibia to reduce the blood sugars. The vibrating massage table was turned to the 
highest level. Headphones playing the proprietary Tri-Vortex frequencies resonated 
in her ears to assist in replacing any tones that may have dropped out in her body.    

The ground vial was placed on the backside of her neck. The Trans-O-Zone vial was 
placed on her sternum for five minutes. And then put on the right lung area for five 
minutes. And then put on the left lung area for five minutes. 
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During this time, I watched the fire-engine red face return to a normal color. Her eyes 
were able to focus as she looked around the room and obviously her temperature was 
reducing. She breathed normally and experienced no pain or congestion after the 
Trans-O-Zone was removed from the left lung. 

The Trans-O-Zone was placed on the lung areas associated with the feet according to 
the art of reflexology. After ten minutes on each foot she stood-up and almost felt 
normal but the pinky and ring fingers were still having moderate pain. 

Next, she laid on the Stem Cell Stimulator table while breathing air pushed by an 
aquarium pump through the Oxygen Ion Generator, an ozone generator and a 
propriety blend of oils. The treated air was delivered by nose cannulas. The same 
procedure was repeated but with silver hydrosol instead of the blended oils. 

While on the water table, I brushed her pinky and ring fingers with the Trans-O-Zone. 

After seventy-five minutes, she was completely symptom free. 

She and her husband are returning for more sessions so the symptom free status can 
remain stable and long-term. I have also offered to complete preventative sessions 
with their children. 

Anyone wanting to donate monies to their relief, please contact me as all funds will 
be paid directly to them. The husband paid me $100.00 for his session and all 
following sessions are at no charge. 

The astonished and grateful expressions on their faces were beyond any monetary 
payment. The children were all over their transformed mommy when she briskly and 
happily walked to the car. 

 

Brian David Andersen brian@trivortex.com  760-999-2233 http://trivortex.com  


